ITB #2550-B: Water Treatment Chemicals

Tally Sheet
Specialty Chemical Chemtrade Chemicals US
Company JClJones Cl i Inc. USALCO, LLC g Mid-South, Inc. LLC Chemrite, The Dycho Company Univar
Unit Estimated
Chemical Size Annual Quantity Unit Price Extended Price| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price UnitPrice |Extended Price| UnitPrice |Extended Price| UnitPrice [Extended Price
DryTon

Liquid Alum AWWA #B403-156 (Dton) 862 No bid No bid $ 583.25 | $ 502,761.50 No bid $  429.00 | $369,798.00 No bid No bid Nonresponsive

2,000 lb.
Liquid Chlorine AWWA #301-18 cylinder 83 No bid $ 1,827.00 | $ 151,641.00 No bid $ 1,742.00 | $ 144,586.00 No bid No bid Nonresponsive No bid
Sodium Silica Fluoride AWWA #B702-18 50 lb bag 876 $85.65 | $75,029.40 No bid No bid $ 69.99 | $ 61,311.24 No bid No bid Nonresp Nonresp
Sodium Hypochlorite AWWA #B300-18 15 galdrum 10 No bid No bid No bid $ 54.90 | $ 549.00 No bid No bid No bid $ 176.70| $  1,767.00
78% Sulfuric Acid NSF Ton 116 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

F-30 $157.50|$3,937.50
Copper Sulfate AWWA #B602-17 50 lb bag 25 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid F-20 $189.00 [$4,725.00 $ 137.50($ 3,437.50| $ 145.69|$ 3,642.25
Exceptions: Exception Note: 55.115 lb No exceptions No exceptions No exceptions No exceptions No exceptions No exceptions No exceptions
bag. 50 lb bags are no longer
available from Prayon
Red fontindicates an error that has been corrected
State Chemical* C&sC C
Unit Estimated

Chemical Size Annual Quantity UnitPrice  |Extended Price| UnitPrice Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

DryTon
Liquid Alum AWWA #B403-156 (Dton) 862

2,000 lb. «9 ((/Q ((9
Liquid Chlorine AWWA #301-18 cylinder 83 \§< & &
Sodium Silica Fluoride AWWA #8702-18 501b bag 876 N Rt X
Sodium Hypochlorite AWWA #B300-18 15 gal drum 10 Q\c" Q\%o' Q\%o'
78% Sulfuric Acid NSF Ton 116
Copper Sulfate AWWA #B602-17 50 lb bag 25

*Disqualified due to not including updated pricing sheet
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