

**1937-B Water Treatment Chemicals
Tally Sheet**

Vendor			Southern States Chemical		C & S Chemicals		The Dycho Co.,Inc.		Univar Solutions USA	
Chemical	Unit Size	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Copper Sulfate AWWA B602 - 17	50 lb. bag	20 bags		\$ -		\$ -	No Bid		(\$3.4125/lb.) \$170.63 bag	\$ 3,412.50
78% Sulfuric Acid NSF	Ton (2,200 gallons per delivery)	78 tons	\$ 247.60	\$ 19,312.80		\$ -	No Bid		No Bid	
Sodium Silica Fluoride AWWA	50 lb. bag, powder	700 bags		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 42.50	\$ 29,750.00	\$59.00 bag (\$1.18/lb.)	\$ 41,300.00
Sodium Hypochlorite AWWA B300-18	15 gal. drum	10 drums		\$ -		\$ -	No Bid		(\$5.28/gal.) \$79.20 drum	\$ 792.00
Liquid Alum AWWA #B403-03	dry ton	650 dry tons		\$ -	\$ 345.00	\$ 224,250.00	No Bid		No Bid	
Chlorine Liq., AWWA B301-18	1 ton cylinders	66 cylinders		\$ -		\$ -	No Bid		No Bid	

Vendor			G20 Technologies, LLC		Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC		Brenntag Mid South		Specialty Chemical Company LLC	
Chemical	Unit Size	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Copper Sulfate AWWA B602 - 17	50 lb. bag	20 bags	No bid		No bid		No Bid		No bid	
78% Sulfuric Acid NSF	Ton (2,200 gallons per delivery)	78 tons	No bid		No bid		No Bid		No bid	
Sodium Silica Fluoride AWWA	50 lb. bag, powder	700 bags	No bid		No bid		\$ 47.00	\$ 32,900.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 33,600.00
Sodium Hypochlorite AWWA B300-18	15 gal. drum	10 drums	No bid		No bid		\$ 39.00	\$ 390.00	No bid	
Liquid Alum AWWA #B403-03	dry ton	650 dry tons	\$ 417.50	\$ 271,375.00	\$ 269.00	\$ 174,850.00	No Bid		No bid	
Chlorine Liq., AWWA B301-18	1 ton cylinders	66 cylinders	No bid		No bid		\$ 659.00	\$ 43,494.00	No bid	