Purchasing Department

FAYETTE 140 Stonewall Avenue West, Ste 204
Fayetteville, GA 30214

1 Phone: 770-305-5420

Create Your StOI‘Y. www.fayettecountyga.gov

April 21, 2021

Subject:  ITB #1937-B: Water Treatment Chemicals

Addendum #3

Gentlemen/Ladies:

Below, please find responses to questions, clarification, or additional information for the above
referenced Request for Quotes. You will need to consider this information when preparing your
quote.

1.

The Bid addendum #2 states Chlorine volume is 66 ton cylinders per year. How many tons of
chlorine do they take at each plant (see below) respectively per shipment?

Chlorine will be 35 cylinders to Crosstown and 31 cylinders to South Fayette. Crosstown orders 5
cylinder at a time as to not go over the risk management plan limit on hand number. South
Fayette will order 3 cylinders at a time.

2. How often do they get a shipment of chlorine at each plant?
About once every two to three months.
3. Do you coordinate orders/shipments of chlorine with both plants each order?
No.
4. How do they unload the chlorine cylinders? Do they utilize a boom/hoist to lift off a flatbed
truck, or do they require a “cherry picker” to set them off the truck?
We have a hoist that only reaches to the end of the loading dock. Delivery truck will need to get
the cylinders to the end of the loading dock.
5. Can we get the previous bid tabs for the alum and chlorine that were listed on addendum 2?
The tally sheets are attached. (Attachments 1 & 2)
This information is posted on our website also:
Liquid Alum https://fayettecountyga.gov/purchasing/archives/2019 bids and proposals.htm
Chlorine https://fayettecountyga.gov/purchasing/archives/2020 bids and proposals.htm
Received by (Name): Company

Note: If this addendum is not returned to the Fayette County Purchasing Department or if it is

returned not signed, responding individuals, companies or other organizations will still be
responsible for the requirements of this addendum and the specifications or changes herein.

The due date and opening date for this ITB was updated in Addendum 1 and has not changed. The
bid due time and date are 12:00 p.m., Tuesday, May 11, 2021. Bids must be received by the



Purchasing Department at the address above, Suite 204, at or before the bid due date and time. A
virtual bid opening will be held that day at 3:00 p.m. The bid opening may be viewed here:
https://vimeo.com/user133262656.

Questions regarding this solicitation will be accepted until 3:00 p.m., Friday, April 23, 2021. After
that, we will not be able to respond to any inquiries about this project.

If you have questions, please contact Natasha Duggan, Contract Administrator at (770) 305-5150,
fax (770) 719-5534 or email at nduggan@fayettecountyga.gov.

Slncerely,

/

Ted L. Burge
Director of Purchasing



MMtachment 1

Tally Sheet
ITB #1667-B: Water System Chemicals
Burnett Lime Co. C&S Chemical Chemtrade Lholst North America Brenntag Affinity Chemical LLC Polytec inc. Chemrite, Inc. Geo Specialty Chemicals
Estimated Annual Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Qua Unit Pri it Pri
Chemical Unit Size ntity Unit Price Prica Unit Price Pl Unit Price Price Unit Price Prica Unit Price Prica Unit Price P nit Price e Unit Price N Unit Price o
Sodium Silicafluoride B $ s $ 534,50 per S s $36.75 per 5
Ib. b id i i 4, X No Bi Bid 25,725.
i 587506 per 50 Ib. bag, powder 700 bags = No Bi P No Bid e No Bid b No Bid big $ 24,150.00 i o Bid Eenb No bog $ 2572500 praye No Bid
s $ s s $ S,
0 0.06672 0.044
Cal-Flo Lime Sturry liquid pounds 2,866,950 SDOSIPer | o 1o 15005 per liquid No Bid per liquid Nogid | ° P (5 191,282.00| perliquid |  NoBid per liquid Nopig | S00MPEr | i vasa0 perliquid | NoBid per liquid No Bid
liquid pound liquid pound liquid pound
pound pound pound pound pound pound
- S s s __ | s A— 5 I B S
Sodium Hypchlorite per 15 gal. drum 10 per 15 gal No Bid per 15 gal No Bid per 15 gal No Bid per 15 gal No Bid 15 Val df:m § 34500 peri5gal No Bid per 15 gal No Bid per 15 gal No Bid per 15 gal No Bid
drum drum drum drum & drum drum drum drum
Liquid Alum AWWA - SN, $295,00 per dry $244.00 per s s $273.00 per 3 ¢ $392.50 per dry|
d 650 dry t Bid 191,750.00 .00 No Bid 450,00 | "——— EET
P per dry ton ry tons e dryvon No it $ 191, dptor $ 158,600, r— o v No Bid Ay von $ 177,450, AT No Bid e drgton| Mo o $ 255,125.00
HTH Chlorine s B $ $ $87.50 per S, $ $82.50 per $
1b./pall 20 Pail No Bid No Bid | wNoBid Bid $ 1,750.00 Bid ,650.
ANSI/AWWA B300-18 S01b./pall L per pound 2 per pound = per pound S per pound Ne 50 Ib pail per pound Ho.BHd per pound Ne 50 Ib. pail # 265010 per pound Nty
Only comes in 100 Ib pails.
Exceptions None None Nene None Price in In SO 1b unlt None None None None




AtHtachment 2.

Tally Sheet
#1802-B: Water System Treatment Chemicals
AMERICAN DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION AULICK CHEMICAL SOLUTIONS BRENNTAG MID SOUTH CARBON ACTIVATED CORP. CHEMRITE, INC.
Extimated
chemical Unit She Annus! Unit Price Extended Price UnitPrice Extended Price Unitprice Extended Price Unitprice Extended Price UnhtPrice Extended Price
Quantity®
Copper Sullate, AWWA B602.17 S0, bag 20mp |5 peshag o bid 5 perbag o bia $10200pertag |5 2.040.00 per bag o bid $105.00perbag | § 210000
7% Sulfuric Ackd HSF “"‘n:fi“:‘::;"“ o | 6 per ton o bid s e ton o bid $32000perton | $ 2496000 | § petion o bid s N o bid
48,00 per !
Sodium Silica Fluonde, AWWA 870218 50 bag, powder | 700bags | 5, perbag o bid s per bag nobid smmr::_ i ":"m”g“ perbag o bid $3950perbag |3 2765000
Sadium Hypochlorite, AWWA B300-18 15 gal. drums 10drums per 15 gal o bid S perlipal o bid 535.25 per 15 gal. drum | § 15250 i no bid s perdipal o bid
drum drum drum drum
Sodium Chiorite, AWWA B303- 100 . drums, 100 drumy per 100 nobid LE— 1 PR 260,50 pe1 100 . dearm| & as000 |5 per 100 b, ok per 1001h, o bid
drum drum drum drum
Powder Activated Carbon, Aqua Nuchar AWWA
bid o 2.
gttt i S0M. bigs wbap | $ per bag o S70.84 per bag (L61/18) | § 283360 |  S46S0perhag | 1,860.00 perbagt |5 172000 8 pot bag nobid
s, s . s s per
S __ ; - I i e
Chiorine i, AWWA B301.04 Ttoneylinders | 66cyinders o o bid oS o bid 5564.00 per cyliner | § 35.244,00 o no bid preren nobid
Total Bid $ - $ 2,833.60 $ 91,306.50 $ 1,720.00 $ 29,750.00
“Enception Noted * Exception Noted *Exception Noted
INDUSTRIAL INTERNATIONAL SOUTHERN STATES
THE DYCHO COMPANY, INC. INC. SPECIALTY CHEMICAL CO LLC
o CHEMICALS, INC. 'DIOKCIDE, INC. PORTEEGH CHEMICAL o
Estimated
Chermical Unht Stze Annus! Unit Price Extended Price Unk Price Extended Price UnitPrice Extended Price UnitPrice Extended Price UnktPrice Extended Price UnitPrice Extended Price
Quantity*
7,50 per bag (2.
Copper Sullate, AWWA BEO2-17 S01b, bag 20 bags s per bag o bid kb '”: bag (23N 255000 | 5. perbag nobid per bag no bid 5. par bag e biet $92.50 per bag* 3 1,850.00
7% Suhuric Ackd HSE T, !‘i“"“";"“ T8om $221.00pertons | § 121800 5 per ton no bid s, perton o bid perton o bid $70000perton | § 1560000 | § perton no bid
per deery
Sodium Silica Fluoride, AWWA 870218 501b. bag, powder | 700 bags s4700perbag” | § 1290000 | s perbag o bid H perbag no bid SI025perbagt |5 namso| s perbag o bid $35.50perbag® | § 285000
r 1
Sodium Hypochiorite, A\WWA 30018 15 gal. drums. 10 drums izl o bid $65.25 pes 15 gal. drum | § ss2.50 | S————per5edl o bid per 15gal o bid per 1l nobid 5222.60 per 15 gal. drum | § 222600
drum drum drum eum
00 b,
Sodium Chiorite, AWWA 830318 100 b, drums 100 drums per 3001 o bid S __peri00ib o bid s e | e ions e P no bid $et 1001 o bid > Pr 200 Ko o bid
drum drum drum® um drurn
Povder Activated Carbon, Aqus Nuchar AWWA
3 bid bid by bid
B600-16, NSF ANSIStandard 61 0. baps aobags | S perbag o bid S__ perbag o bid S perbag no perbag e H per bag o s per bag o bid
5 s pee H . H per s, pee s, per
o U ¥ " T — bid o — b
Ctine L AWV B20L00 4 cylinder o bid eylmder Lt eylinder i eylinder ool eylinder e eylinder L
Total Bid H 50,138.00 $ 3,202.50 s - $ 21,175.00 s 15,600.00 $ 18,926.00
*Exception Noted *Exception Noted “Exception Noted “Exeeption Noted



