
Chemical Unit Size
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity*

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Copper Sulfate, AWWA B602-17 50 lb. bag 20 bags $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $102.00 per bag 2,040.00$                          $__________ per bag no bid $105.00 per bag 2,100.00$                          

78% Sulfuric Acid NSF
Ton (2,200 gallons 

per delivery)
78 tons $__________ per ton no bid $__________ per ton no bid $320.00 per ton 24,960.00$                        $__________ per ton no bid $__________ per ton no bid

Sodium Silica Fluoride, AWWA B702-18 50 lb. bag, powder 700 bags $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid
$40.00 OR $48.00 per 

bag*
$28,000.00 OR 

$33,600.00
$__________ per bag no bid $39.50 per bag 27,650.00$                        

Sodium Hypochlorite, AWWA B300-18 15 gal. drums 10 drums
$__________ per 15 gal. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 15 gal. 
drum

no bid $35.25 per 15 gal. drum 352.50$                              
$__________ per 15 gal. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 15 gal. 
drum

no bid

Sodium Chlorite, AWWA B303-18 100 lb. drums 100 drums
$__________ per 100 lb. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 100 lb. 
drum

no bid $268.50 per 100 lb. drum 26,850.00$                        
$__________ per 100 lb. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 100 lb. 
drum

no bid

Powder Activated Carbon, Aqua Nuchar AWWA 
B600-16,  NSF ANSI Standard 61

50 lb. bags 40 bags $__________ per bag no bid $70.84 per bag (1.61/LB) 2,833.60$                          $46.50 per bag 1,860.00$                          $__________ per bag* 1,720.00$                          $__________ per bag no bid

Chlorine Liq, AWWA B301-04 1 ton cylinders 66 cylinders
$__________ per 

cylinder
no bid

$__________ per 
cylinder

no bid $564.00 per cylinder 35,244.00$                        
$__________ per 

cylinder
no bid

$__________ per 
cylinder

no bid

Total Bid -$                          2,833.60$                91,306.50$             1,720.00$                29,750.00$             

*Exception Noted *Exception Noted *Exception Noted

INDUSTRIAL 
CHEMICALS, INC.

INTERNATIONAL 
DIOXCIDE, INC.

POLYTEC, INC.
SOUTHERN STATES 

CHEMICAL

Chemical Unit Size
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity*

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Copper Sulfate, AWWA B602-17 50 lb. bag 20 bags $__________ per bag no bid
$127.50 per bag (2.55/lb) 

Medium
2,550.00$                          $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $92.50 per bag* 1,850.00$                          

78% Sulfuric Acid NSF
Ton (2,200 gallons 

per delivery)
78 tons $221.00 per ton* 17,238.00$                        $__________ per ton no bid $__________ per ton no bid $__________ per ton no bid $200.00 per ton 15,600.00$                        $__________ per ton no bid

Sodium Silica Fluoride, AWWA B702-18 50 lb. bag, powder 700 bags $47.00 per bag* 32,900.00$                        $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $30.25 per bag* 21,175.00$                        $__________ per bag no bid $35.50 per bag* 24,850.00$                        

Sodium Hypochlorite, AWWA B300-18 15 gal. drums 10 drums
$__________ per 15 gal. 

drum
no bid $65.25 per 15 gal. drum 652.50$                              

$__________ per 15 gal. 
drum

no bid
$__________ per 15 gal. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 15 gal. 
drum

no bid $222.60 per 15 gal. drum 2,226.00$                          

Sodium Chlorite, AWWA B303-18 100 lb. drums 100 drums
$__________ per 100 lb. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 100 lb. 
drum

no bid
$__________ per 100 lb. 

drum*
see exceptions page

$__________ per 100 lb. 
drum

no bid
$__________ per 100 lb. 

drum
no bid

$__________ per 100 lb. 
drum

no bid

Powder Activated Carbon, Aqua Nuchar AWWA 
B600-16,  NSF ANSI Standard 61

50 lb. bags 40 bags $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid $__________ per bag no bid

Chlorine Liq, AWWA B301-04 1 ton cylinders 66 cylinders
$__________ per 

cylinder
no bid

$__________ per 
cylinder

no bid
$__________ per 

cylinder
no bid

$__________ per 
cylinder

no bid
$__________ per 

cylinder
no bid

$__________ per 
cylinder

no bid

Total Bid 50,138.00$             3,202.50$                -$                          21,175.00$             15,600.00$             28,926.00$             

*Exception Noted *Exception Noted *Exception Noted *Exception Noted
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