
Tally Sheet
ITB #1667-B: Water System Chemicals

Burnett Lime Co. C&S Chemical Chemtrade Lhoist North America Brenntag Affinity Chemical LLC Polytec Inc. Chemrite, Inc. Geo Specialty Chemicals

Chemical Unit Size Estimated Annual 
Quantity

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Sodium Silicafluoride 
AWWA #B702-06

per 50 lb. bag, powder 700 bags
$_________ 

per bag
No Bid

$_________ 
per bag

No Bid
$_________ 

per bag
No Bid

$_________ 
per bag

No Bid
$34.50 per 

bag
 $  24,150.00 

$_________ 
per bag

No Bid
$_________ 

per bag
No Bid

$36.75 per 
bag

 $  25,725.00 
$_________ 

per bag
No Bid

Cal-Flo Lime Slurry liquid pounds  2,866,950 
$0.059 per 

liquid pound
 $  169,150.05 

$_________ 
per liquid 

pound
No Bid

$_________ 
per liquid 

pound
No Bid

$0.06672 per 
liquid pound

 $  191,282.90 
$_________ 

per liquid 
pound

No Bid
$_________ 

per liquid 
pound

No Bid
$0.044 per 

liquid pound
 $  126,145.80 

$_________ 
per liquid 

pound
No Bid

$_________ 
per liquid 

pound
No Bid

Sodium Hypchlorite per 15 gal. drum 10
$_________ 

per 15 gal 
drum

No Bid
$_________ 

per 15 gal 
drum

No Bid
$_________ 

per 15 gal 
drum

No Bid
$_________ 

per 15 gal 
drum

No Bid
$34.50 per 

15 gal drum
 $       345.00 

$_________ 
per 15 gal 

drum
No Bid

$_________ 
per 15 gal 

drum
No Bid

$_________ 
per 15 gal 

drum
No Bid

$_________ 
per 15 gal 

drum
No Bid

Liquid Alum           AWWA 
#B403-03

per dry ton 650 dry tons
$_________ 
per dry ton

No Bid
$295.00 per dry 

ton
 $  191,750.00 

$244.00 per 
dry ton

 $  158,600.00 
$_________ 
per dry ton

No Bid
$_________ 
per dry ton

No Bid
$273.00 per 

dry ton
 $  177,450.00 

$_________ 
per dry ton

No Bid
$_________ 
per dry ton

No Bid
$392.50 per dry 

ton
 $  255,125.00 

HTH Chlorine 
ANSI/AWWA B300-18

50 lb./pail  20 Pails 
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid
$87.50 per 
50 lb pail

 $    1,750.00 
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid
$82.50 per 
50 lb. pail

 $    1,650.00 
$_________ 
per pound

No Bid

Exceptions None None None None
Only comes in 100 lb pails. 

Price in in 50 lb unit
None None None None
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