BID NUMBER: #8173

BID NAME: GRASS MOWING SERVICES

OPENING DATE:

3:00PM, TUESDAY, MARCH 12, 2013

FC JUSTICE CENTER

MCCURRY
BROOKS PARK | KIWANIS PARK PARK TOTAL PRICE
TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID FOR EACH SPECIFY ANY DISCOUNTS IF
PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER [APPLICATION AWARDED 2 OR MORE
RESPONDENTS NAME MONTH MONTH MONTH MONTH BALE OF 450 BALES LOCATIONS
3-D LANDSCAPING AND LAWN SERVICE, INCORPORATED $2,290.00 $3,855.00 $4,890.00 $2,460.00 $6.00 $2,700.00 2% 15, NET 30
AABBY GROUP INC. NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,750.00 $4.85 $2,182.50
2% DISCOUNT IF AWARDED BOTH
BEAUTYSCAPES MANAGEMENT INC. $2,180.00 NO BID NO BID $1,480.00 $3.00 $2,000.00 LOCATION
12% DISCOUNT FOR MORE THAN
ONE LOCATION. 15% DISCOUNT
ESTES LANDSCAPE DESIGN INC. $7,700.00 $13,860.00 $12,320.00 $1,771.88 $5.00 $2,250.00 FOR ALL LOCATIONS.
FRANKS BROTHERS LANDSCAPE / FRANKS TURF CARE $2,904.00 $6,600.00 $3,520.00 $1,500.00 $4.00 $1,800.00
GRASSHOPPER LAWN RECOVERY $1,650.00 $1,650.00 $1,650.00 $1,750.00 $3.69 $3,150.00 5% DISCOUNT ON EACH LOCATION
KINGS LANDSCAPING & LAWN CARE $2,210.00 $3,850.00 $2,798.00 $1,268.00 $4.75 $2,137.50 NONE
PRICES SUBMITTED ARE VALID
PATTILLO GROUNDS MANAGEMENT, INC. NO BID $3,938.00 $2,825.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID ONLY IF AWARDED BOTH PARKS.
STAR VALLEY LANDSCAPE SOLUTIONS LLC $4,200.00 $6,500.00 $4,000.00 $1,140.00 $4.00 $1,800.00 5%
TRUGREEN LANDCARE LLC $2,215.57 $3,444.28 $2,639.57 $1,399.83 $5.00 $2,250.00 NO DISCOUNTS




