Fayette County, Georgia

Request for Proposals #852, Sports Lighting

Original Price Proposals

MIDDLE GEORGIA OUTDOOR LIGHTING

Less: If
M. Gay Bonding Not
Donald Camp, | Constructors, Gross Required on
Description Inc. Inc. Bid Lighting Equip Net Bid
KIWANIS PARK BASEBALL FIELD #11 $42,350.00 $48,900.00 $50,5663.00 ($1,000.00) $49 563.00
MCCURRY PARK SOFTBALL FIELD #7 131,080.00 124,900.00 130,175.00 (2,900.00) $127,275.00
MCCURRY PARK FOOTBALL FIELD #3 172,600.00 163,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Fields in Final Selection $346,030.00 $336,800.00 $180,738.00 ($3,900.00) $176,838.00
MCCURRY PARK SOFTBALL FIELD #6 120,475.00 114,000.00 118,219.00 {2,600.00) $115,619.00
MCCURRY PARK SOCCER FIELD #1 85,425.00 93,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MCCURRY PARK SOCCER FIELD #4 119,945.00 109,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for All Fields Considered $671,875.00 $652,800.00 $298,957.00 ($6,500.00) $292,457.00
Discount if Awarded Any Two or More (1,000.00) (2,500.00) {2,500.00)
Net Total After Discounts $670,875.00 $652,800.00 $296,457.00 ($6,500.00) $289,957.00

Note: Middle Georgia Qutdoor Lighting offers a discount of $2,500 if McCurry Park softball fields #6 and 7 are awarded.
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