
Location
Price for Initial 
Cut & Clean up 

(if any)
Price per Cut

Number of Cuts (July 
1 - Oct 31, March 15 - 

June 30)

Total Price for 
Cuts

Total Price 
Price for Initial 
Cut & Clean up 

(if any)
Price per Cut

Number of Cuts (July 
1 - Oct 31, March 15 - 

June 30)

Total Price for 
Cuts

Total Price 

a b c b x c = d a + d a b c b x c = d a + d
Lake McIntosh 550.00$              550.00$         18 9,900.00$        10,450.00$  -$                     400.00$            18 7,200.00$        7,200.00$        
Lake Horton 800.00$              750.00$         18 13,500.00$      14,300.00$  -$                     900.00$            18 16,200.00$      16,200.00$      
Total Quote 24,750.00$  23,400.00$      

Location
Price for Initial 
Cut & Clean up 

(if any)
Price per Cut

Number of Cuts (July 
1 - Oct 31, March 15 - 

June 30)

Total Price for 
Cuts

Total Price 
Price for Initial 
Cut & Clean up 

(if any)
Price per Cut

Number of Cuts (July 
1 - Oct 31, March 15 - 

June 30)

Total Price for 
Cuts

Total Price 

a b c b x c = d a + d a b c b x c = d a + d
Lake McIntosh -$                    1,456.00$      18 26,208.00$      26,208.00$  -$                     1,920.00$        18 34,560.00$      34,560.00$      
Lake Horton -$                    641.00$         18 11,538.00$      11,538.00$  -$                     3,840.00$        18 69,120.00$      69,120.00$      
Total Quote 37,746.00$  103,680.00$   

Location
Price for Initial 
Cut & Clean up 

(if any)
Price per Cut

Number of Cuts (July 
1 - Oct 31, March 15 - 

June 30)

Total Price for 
Cuts

Total Price 

a b c b x c = d a + d
Lake McIntosh 800.00$              800.00$         18 14,400.00$      15,200.00$  
Lake Horton no bid no bid 18 no bid no bid
Total Quote 15,200.00$  

*Red font indicates correction of mathmatical error.
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