3:00pm April 18,2023

JUSTICE CENTER

#2225-B Grass Cutting Services
TALLY SHEET

RUBBER BOOTS LAWN CARE

WORLD SCAPES LLC

ASAP LANDSCAPE MGMT

TYCO SOLUTIONS

PRICE PER CUT/ PRICE PER CUT/ PRICE PER CUT/ PRICE PER CUT/
LOCATION ESTIMATED CUTS PER YEAR |~ oo -0 0" | EXTENDED PRICE | *, oo -0 ' | EXTENDED PRICE | © o -0~ | EXTENDED PRICE | © oo -0 | EXTENDED PRICE
JUSTICE CENTER -WEEKLY CUT
(FRIDAY OR SATURDAY) 52 $500.00 $26,000.00 $575.00 $29,900.00 $3,600.00 $187,200.00 $438.46 $22,799.92
ONE APPLICATION OF 450 BALES OF
PINE STRAW. WINTER 1 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $3,850.00 $3,850.00 $4,725.00 $4,725.00
ONE APPLICATION OF 450 BALES OF
PINE STRAW. SUMMER 1 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $3,850.00 $3,850.00 $4,725.00 $4,725.00
TOTAL ANNUAL AMT. $31,600.00 $35,300.00 $194,900.00 $32,249.92
BROOKS PARK
LOCATION ESTIMATED CUTS PER YEAR | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE
BROOKS PARK -FIRST CUT (MONDAY) 31 $900.00 $27,900.00 $325.00 $10,075.00 $3,600.00 $111,600.00 $461.53 $14,307.43
BROOKS PARK — SECOND CUT
(THURSDAY) THIS CUT INCLUDES 30 $1,200.00 $36,000.00 $1,150.00 $34,500.00 $4,800.00 $144,000.00 $561.53 $16,845.90
ALL OUTLINES AND PARK AREAS
TOTAL ANNUAL AMT. $63,900.00 $44,575.00 $255,600.00 $31,153.33
KIWANIS PARK
LOCATION ESTIMATED CUTS PER YEAR | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE
KIWANIS PARK -FIRST CUT — BALL . .
FIELDS ONLY (MONDAY) 31 no bid 0 $600.00 $18,600.00 $3,600.00 $111,600.00[no bid 0
KIWANIS PARK — SECOND CUT —
BALL FIELDS AND PARK OUTLINES . .
TO INCLUDE COMMON AREAS 30 no bid 0 $1,400.00 $42,000.00 $4,800.00 $144,000.00[no bid 0
(THURSDAY)
TOTAL ANNUAL AMT. $ 0 $60,600.00 $255,600.00 0
MCCURRY PARK
LOCATION ESTIMATED CUTS PER YEAR | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE PER CUT | EXTENDED PRICE
MCCURRY PARK -FIRST CUT 31 $450.00 $13,950.00 $425.00 $13,175.00 $3,600.00 $111,600.00 $461.53 $14,307.43
(MONDAY)
MCCURRY PARK — SECOND CUT
INCLUDES BALL FIELDS AND PARK
Q
OUTLINES AND COMMON AREAS 30 $900.00 $27,000.00 $1,025.00 $30,750.00 $4,800.00 $144,000.00 $561.53 $16,845.90
(THURSDAY)
TOTAL ANNUAL AMT. $40,950.00 $43,925.00 $255,600.00 $31,153.33
DISCOUNT IF AWARDED ALL
LOCATIONS 0 $8,732.00 0 0
NET ANNUAL AMOUNT FOR $136,450.00 $175,668.00 $961,700.00 $94,556.58

ALL LOCATIONS

*% Light blue prices indicates calculation correction




