ITB #2077-B: Water Treatment Chemicals

Tally Sheet
C & S Chemicals Affinity Chemical LLC Brenntag Southeast, Inc. Chemrite Chemtrade G20 Technologies LLC Southern States Chemical Univar
i Estimated
Chemical U-mt ... | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price| Unit Price Exte.nded Unit Price Exte.nded Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Exte.nded Unit Price Exte.nded

Size |Annual Quantity Price Price Price Price
Chlorine (liquid) ZC\?“O"T: 56 cylinders No bid No bid $ 1,597.00 | $ 89,432.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Sodium Silica Fluoride AWWA #B702 - 18
<hall be Prayon Material *no exceptonsto |02 730 bags No bid No bid S 80.13|$ 58494.90 | $ 106.99 | $ 78,102.70 No bid No bid No bid 85.105/bagor | ¢ o) 15665
material or bag size* power 1.7021/ Ib.
Hydrofluosilicic Acid AWWA #8703-19 "z’c“z‘:“:d 176,400  Ibs. No bid No bid $ 0.27 | $ 47,733.84 No bid No bid No bid No bid S 0.49 | $ 86,436.00
Liquid Alum. AWWA #B403-16 dry ton 640 drytons | $ 545.00 | $ 348,800.00 | $ 439.00 [ $ 280,960.00 No bid No bid $ 414.00 | $ 264,960.00 | $ 537.50 | $ 344,000.00 No bid No bid
Copper Sulfate AWWA #B602 - 17 50lb.bag| 20 bags No bid No bid $ 13275 |$ 2,655.00 | $ 23250 | $  4,650.00 No bid No bid No bid S 199.91 | $ 3,998.10
Sodium Hypochlorite AWWA #B300-18 15 gal. 10 drums No bid No bid S 52.50 | $ 525.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid $67.32/drum or $ 673.20

drum 4.4877/gal

Ton

78% Sulfuric Acid NSF (2,200 96 tons No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 397.00 | $ 38,112.00 No bid

gallons

Exceptions:

No exceptions

Exception Note: Pricing good
through 12/31/2022

Exceptions Note: Chlorine Lig.
Quarterly pricing only.
Hydrofluosilicic Acid Pricing good
through 12/31/2022. Any order must|
be $600 or more

No exceptions

No exceptions

No exceptions

No exceptions

No exceptions
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